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Refugees of the Revolution

According to the United Nations Relief and Works
Agency (UNRWA), some 425,000 Palestinian refugees
have registered with the agency in Lebanon since the
creation of Israel and the subsequent expulsion and dis-
placement of the native Palestinian population in 1948.
Currently about 260,000 still live in refugee camps scat-
tered around Lebanon, including 9,154 who reside in the
camp of Shatila on the outskirts of the Lebanese capital
Beirut. In addition, a large number of refugees are es-
sentially unaccounted for because they never registered
with UNRWA. Refugees of the Revolution: Experiences of
Palestinian Exile is an ethnography of the Palestinian res-
idents of Shatila, which, along with the neighboring area
known as Sabra, was the site of the horrific 1982 mas-
sacre of Palestinian civilians at the hands of right-wing
Lebanese militias acting under the oversight of the in-
vading Israeli army. Drawing on the pioneering work of
Rosemary Sayigh (Too Many Enemies: The Palestinian Ex-
perience in Lebanon [1994]) and aiming to produce what
Lila Abu-Lughod calls âethnographies of the particular,â
Diana Allan, a British anthropologist and activist, has

written an important, provocative, and compelling ac-
count of the âfractured,â âembattled,â and âpragmaticâ
lives, and the âlived experiencesâ of the campâs Pales-
tinian residents (p. 1).

The ârevolutionâ in the title of the book refers to the
Palestinian Resistance Movementâs arrival in Lebanon in
the early seventies, an era known commonly among the
Palestinians as al thawra, âthe revolution.â The Shatila
camp effectively became the headquarters of the Pales-
tinian leadership, ushering in a period that residents of
Shatila have described as a âtime of considerable pros-
perity and convictionâ (p. 3). With the evacuation of the
Palestine Liberation Organization (PLO) from Lebanon in
1982, the residents of Shatila, like the rest of the Palestini-
ans of Lebanon, lost their protectors, providers, and em-
ployers, and became refugees a second time, originally
as refugees of the 1948 catastrophe (Nakba) when they
lost their homes and country, and now as refugees of the
Palestinian revolution that had sheltered and protected
them. As a result, unemployment levels in all camps, in-
cluding Shatila, are extremely high, and approximately
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two-thirds of Palestinian refugees subsist on less than six
dollars per day.

Expelled by Israel, marginalized and impoverished by
Lebanon, and ultimately deserted by the Palestinian rev-
olution, the stateless and abandoned refugees of Shatila
were left to fend for themselves, with some support
from UNRWA, various nongovernmental organizations
(NGOs), and some international solidarity networks. In
focusing on the âpragmatics of everyday lifeâ in the
camp, Allan explores how the refugees have come to
terms with âradical exclusion, alienation, and the indig-
nities of refugee existence, and the daily struggle with
poverty, loss, and political disenchantmentâ (p. 27). In
doing so, she gives voice and agency to the refugees
themselves, exploring with them their inner feelings, the
questions they ask, and the compensatory tactics they
employ as they consider all the options open to them.
Individuals, as Allan asserts, are not âobjects of knowl-
edge but active practitionersâ who should be allowed to
speak for themselves (p. 28). She grounds her theoretical
and methodological approaches in the anthropology of
practice; the writings of Pierre Bourdieu, especially his
theory of practice and his notion of illusio (the ability to
invest oneself in a meaningful life); and the language of
social phenomenology. This is a book not only about how
refugees relate to the past, a topic thatmany authors have
extensively explored, but also, and more significantly,
about how they orient themselves to the future. The past
is the source of national and community identity, the re-
membered, the imagined, and the ever-present Palestine.
It is built on a discourse of steadfastness and eventual
return to Palestine; its language is the language of what
is arguably the single most important tenet of Palestinian
identity and Palestinian exile, namely, the right of return,
held dear especially by Palestinian refugees, and recog-
nized and established by international law.

While the orientation to the future is filled with talk
of the present realities of the camp residentsâdiscrimi-
nation, repression, and povertyâit is also filled with the
âmurmuredâ and whispered talk of the seeming futility
of waiting to return to Palestine and the need for assim-
ilation, emigration, or asylum (p. 32). No one is willing
to concede the right of return, but the poverty and harsh
realities of everyday life are forcing people to rethink the
language of the national discourse. What does the right
of return mean as one tries to imagine a personal and na-
tional future? This is a hard question for all Palestinians,
but especially so for those living in camps like Shatila.
How should one think of the return? Is the return actual,
both physically and spatially? Should it take the form of

monetary compensation in return for resettlement else-
where? Is it national, communal, and symbolic, perhaps
culminating in a truncated Palestinian Authority state on
theWest Bank and Gaza? Or is it a personal one, one that
demands the return of humanity and personal dignity,
the recognition of the injustice of the Nakba that must
be acknowledged first and foremost by the Israeli state
and its people? In an interview, a refugee named Mu-
nir expressed these sentiments loudly and clearly. When
asked by Allan if he imagined himself returning to Haifa
from where his family was expelled, Munir stated: âMy
life is not in Haifa; what is there for me now?… I want
the right to knock on the door of my fatherâs house and
say to the people living there, âThis is my fatherâs house,
which you took from him in 1948. I understand that you
are living here now, and thatâs okay. I donât want to
live here, but I want you to acknowledge that you took
this from him and from me.â … When we talk about re-
turn, this is what we are talking aboutâthe return of our
dignityâ (p. 195).

Allanâs initial contact with the people of Shatila came
as part of her volunteer work with a womenâs NGO in
the camp. Returning a year later to do anthropological
research on narrative re-creation of pre-1948 Palestine,
she was struck by conditions in the camp and especially
by the âwillful optimism, resilience, and forbearanceâ of
the people of the camp, particularly Umm Mahmud, the
woman from whom Allan rented a room and who ex-
tended ties of fictive kinship and support to her. She
shifted the focus of her research away from the âdiscur-
sive continuities of nationalism toward the contingencies
of everyday experienceâ (p. 21). The six chapters that
form the core of this book provide the reader with a clear
and vivid appreciation of the daily lives of the campâs
residents, their struggles and challenges as well as their
hopes and dreams.

In the bookâs first chapter, âCommemorative
Economies,â Allan describes and critiques what she calls
the âcottage industry of commemorationâ of the Nakba
and subsequent disasters that have befallen the Pales-
tinians in Lebanon (p. 40). While collecting oral stories
from the refugees, she was struck by the âpracticed,
even stylizedâ nature of the memories of the refugees
of 1948, which are now âunconsciously performedâ and
have become âstandardized and circulate almost as com-
moditiesâ (pp. 46-47). NGOs and solidarity networks are
complicit, directly and indirectly, in the perpetuation of
a Nakba industry, a heroic nationalist discourse of suf-
fering that âobscure[s] localized, less tangible legacies
of 1948 currently existing in the memories, experiences,
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and hopes of refugees in the diasporaâ (p. 45). The chap-
ter ends with interviews with the younger generation of
Palestinian refugees who never experienced the Nakba,
who are âwary of … fetishization of the national entity,â
and who ârefuse to inheritâ the Nakba (p. 61). Allanâs
call for a new scholarship that âmoves beyond the coer-
cive harmony of a national identity rooted in past history
in order to include emergent forms of subjectivity … and
[recognizes] that these new forms may privilege individ-
ual aspiration over collective, nationalist imperativesâ is
heartfelt and valid, but it is also a bit problematic (pp.
66-67). The split between individual and collective aspi-
rations is at some level artificial and need not be absolute;
the focus on the subjective exigencies of the refugeesâ
everyday life, so vividly described by Allan, need not
preclude a continued emphasis on the political and his-
torical discourse surrounding the Palestiniansâ national
hopes and aspirations, even if the memories are stylisti-
cally performed. After all, the Palestinians, like all other
people, have the right to narrate their history and per-
form their culture as they see, experience, and feel it,
regardless of how artificial, inauthentic, or staged it may
seem to the outside world.

Chapter 2, âEconomic Subjectivity and Everyday Sol-
idarities,â considers the changing political economy of
Shatila following the departure of the PLO in 1982. Al-
lan shows how structural poverty transforms social rela-
tions, reducing the role of kinship as an important prin-
ciple that governs familial rights, obligations, and re-
sponsibilities. Through the lives of three camp women,
she demonstrates the decline of customary relations
and communal solidarity built around notions of âmoral
familism,â and the simultaneous rise of ânew forms of so-
ciality and support motivated by the imperative of eco-
nomic survival and by an ethics of care rooted in the
shared experience of privationâ (p. 73). Though still ac-
tive, village associations that provided financial support
for camp dwellers gave way to the mosque as a source
of funds for needy families. Friends and neighbors have
gradually replaced relatives as a source of social and eco-
nomic support, although as Allan points out, the âpri-
mordial ties of kin and village … have an afterlife and
are being newly inhabitedâ (p. 99). Political loyalties
and allegiances based on nationalist goals and collec-
tive interests have been replaced by an entrenched sys-
tem of âclientelism and factionalism,â made necessary by
the politics of everyday existence (p. 93). The prolifera-
tion of NGOs following the departure of the PLO did lit-
tle to ameliorate the economic duress that camp inhabi-
tants faced. Accusations of corruption as money was be-

ing siphoned off and the ânormalization of dependencyâ
were mentioned by camp residents as they questioned
the ubiquitous presence of NGOs in the camp (p. 94). The
support provided by UNRWA, which had reclaimed its
role as the agency responsible for providing water, elec-
tricity, and sanitation services following the departure of
the PLO, was paltry and subject to crippling restrictions,
such as a provision that only those under sixty could be
granted assistance in situations of chronic illness (p. 69).

Continuing her theme of the âneed to develop alter-
native paradigms for conceptualizing camp communities
and Palestinian identityâ and âshifting analytical atten-
tion away from the discursive continuities of national-
ism toward the contingencies of lived experience and
material practice in local environments,â Allan consid-
ers the politics of âelectrical piracyâ by camp residents
as a form of resistance, the subject of her bookâs third
chapter, âStealing Powerâ (p. 102). She traces the his-
tory of electricity provision to Shatila, focusing on the
camp residentsâ relationship with Lebanonâs state-run
power company known by its French acronym EdL. The
void left by the departure of the PLO was filled by the
elected âPeopleâs Committee,â which became the princi-
pal mediator for the campâs residents not just with EdL
but alsowith the Lebanese authorities. Her description of
the Peopleâs Committee elections in 2005, during which
the community attempted to confront corruption and re-
claim moral leadership, neatly illustrates how material
struggles reshaped political engagement in the camp. She
concludes the chapter by explaining that times of crisis
produce sporadic actions that âeffect political change by
producing structured, harmonized, and articulate move-
ments [that are] neither explicitly nationalist nor ideo-
logical in structureâ; these movements, she argues, be-
come intelligible only when one considers them âin re-
lation to an intricate politics of everyday survivalâ (pp.
134, 135). She is correct to point out that peopleâs daily
struggles need not be imbued with nationalist or ideolog-
ical motives; stealing electrical power is but one example
of how the poor develop strategies of survival, regardless
of their sense of national identity and their nationalist as-
pirations. It is interesting to note that electricity theft is
an effective and popular strategy used by many refugees
and poor people all over the world. Reports coming out
of the Zaatari refugee camp housing Syrian refugees in
Jordan relate similar incidents of electric power piracy.

In chapter 4, âDream Talk, Futurity, and Hope,â Al-
lan explores the world of dream narration and inter-
pretation practiced by women in the camp. She calls
it âdream talk,â explaining it as a ritual that âinforms
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how people relate to one another, even assert power over
one anotherâ (p. 138). She is interested in dream talk
not in a Freudian psychological sense, but in its social
significance both as a âdiscursive practice to make life
more bearable or facilitate continuity in the face of rup-
tureâ and as a âmedium through which to explore future-
oriented thought and imaginative practice, individual
and shared,â one that can âenable refugees to imagine
a future different from their presentâ (pp. 140, 139). The
authorâs interest in dream interpretation, a highly gen-
dered activity, was met with skepticism by men in the
camp. âDo dreams have any bearing on the larger po-
litical questions and concerns of the community,â asked
Abu Ali, the father of Umm Mahmud. I admit that Al-
lanâs response to the questionâthat dream talk is âinher-
ently political because it shapes social and moral rela-
tions and establishes new forms of connectedness, both
in the actual world of the camp and in invisible but mean-
ingful worlds beyond,â and that it âforms the basis of
reciprocal relations that can extend beyond the human
to include the divine and the invisibleââleft me uncon-
vinced and unsatisfied (pp. 157, 138). Perhaps I am one
of the ârationalists and secularists [for whom] dreams are
murky, obscure, and unverifiable,â but I confess I find it
hard to see how her notion of dream talk can enhance the
arguments that she pursues in the book (p. 139).

The remaining chapters return to what I believe is the
heart of the book: the future of the Palestinian refugees
in Lebanon, and by extension Palestinian refugees else-
where. As has become clear to the rest of the world,
the possibility of any immediate and just solution to the
Palestine question is at best remote. More than any-
one else, the refugees of Shatila have known this sad
truth for a long time, as it has been obvious to them
that while there is little likelihood of a bright future for
any Palestinian refugees, prospects for the refugees of
Shatila and those living in Lebanonâs other camps are
especially bleak. They are people caught in an untenable
situation, an âexistential impasse,â with no promise of
hope for a meaningful life (p. 174). Torn between attach-
ments to a camp that ideologically and symbolically rep-
resents both their national identity and their resistance to
displacement and resettlement on the one hand, and the
âhostageâ state of constant struggle, dispossession, and
âterminal limboâ on the other, many have turned to emi-
gration and asylum as practical and material options that
would afford promise of a better life in Europe or else-
where (pp. 188, 173). In so doing, they are clearly aware
that leaving the camp and moving to Europe or Canada
undermines the right of return which they continue to

hold on to dearly, but perhaps only rhetorically. As Allan
points out, âlives established elsewhere have unsettled
and redefined the relationship between home and home-
land in subtle but significant ways,â thus complicating
âthe relation of refugees to a Palestinian âhomelandâ and
by extension the meaning of âhomeâ and âreturnââ (pp.
187, 188).

As discussions about the right of return becomemore
open and more inclusive, various meanings and forms
of return are being considered and debated by Palestini-
ansâfrom all social and economic classes, both refugees
and non-refugeesâusing language that was considered
forbidden until recently. The survey conducted in 2003
by Khalil Shikaki of the Palestinian Center for Policy
and Survey Research led to both anger and much soul-
searching among Palestinians in its finding that if the âle-
gal and material conditions of refugees in Lebanon were
to improve, the majority would prefer to remain, with
only 23 percent electing to return to their ancestral vil-
lagesâ (p. 202). In response, an international Right of
Return Movement sought to define the right of return
in purely nationalistic terms, culminating in the 2011
âMarch of Returnâ in which Palestinian refugees from
Lebanon, Syria, and Jordan marched to the Israeli bor-
ders; the Israeli newspaperHaâaretz described this as the
ânightmare scenario Israel feared since its inceptionâ (p.
203). While in practical terms the march had no terri-
torial impact, it nonetheless served to solidify the Pales-
tinian refugees as a ânewly visible political collectiveâ of
ârights-bearing claimantsâ (p. 209).

Recognizing the extreme delicacy of critically dis-
cussing the discourse over the right of return, and aware
of its power as a signifier of Palestinian national iden-
tity, Allan is careful to clearly state that her âscrutiniz-
ing of the moral ambiguities of the discourse of return
for communities like Shatila … [is not] morally prescrip-
tiveâ; rather, her argument takes to task the âscholars,
writers, and activists who constitute a kind of loose-knit
international solidarity group for Palestiniansâ (p. 211).
She is very clear in her demand for âmore supple and
reflective forms of solidarity, forms that engage and in-
tegrate the range of refugee perspectives on this issue.â
And lest the reader think that she is talking only about
the work of others, she explicitly and unambiguously in-
cludes herself among the âscholars, activists and chron-
iclers … who set out to give voice and end up taking it
awayâ (p. 213). The book is suffused with self-doubt and
worryâabout the implications of what she is describing,
about the fear that her ethnographic descriptions are not
sufficiently nuanced, and about the manner in which she
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conveys to the reader what the campâs inhabitants told
her and what she has observed. In the final analysis, of
course, Allan is talking here about representation: Who
speaks for the refugees in the camps, and by extension,
who speaks for the Palestinians as a whole? The fail-
ure of so many Palestinian political structures and the
factionalism that plagues Palestinian politics and soci-
ety have made the question of representation that much
more thorny and critical.

This is an honest and provocative book that demands
close reading and clear understanding of what the au-
thor describes and writes about. Allan is a very care-
ful and introspective writer, acutely aware of every word
she writes. She understands how easily these words can
be misconstrued and misinterpreted. A compassionate
sympathizer with the Palestinian predicament, she nev-
ertheless places her duty as an ethnographer and anthro-
pologist above her personal commitments as an activist.
âWhile I have reservations about the way my work may
be interpreted and used, as an anthropologist, my first
duty,â she writes in the bookâs conclusion, âis to rep-
resent the concerns and experiences of my interlocutors
and friends, as they have described them to meâ (p. 224);
in this richly researched, amply annotated, and theoreti-
cally grounded ethnography, she has done so eloquently
and courageously.

This book should be read by anyone interested in the
question of Palestine and the Palestinian people, espe-
cially by politicians and diplomats who debate and nego-
tiate the future of the Palestinians as refugees, as a peo-
ple, and as a nation. It should also be read by Palestinians
around the world: the âeliteâ who have the luxury of ab-
stractly negotiating their personal identity and their ties
to Palestine; middle-class Palestinians who have assim-
ilated to varying degrees, throughout the world; those

who live as Palestinian citizens of Israel, or have lived
under Israeli occupation for many decades (West Bank),
or are under perpetual siege by Israel (Gaza); and the
refugees who continue to live in camps throughout the
Middle East. The themes and issues the book discusses
should be part of the global Palestinian conversation, in
both its private and its public domains. Most especially,
however, this book should be read by Israelis whoâknow-
ingly or unknowingly, directly or indirectly, willingly or
unwillinglyâultimately bear somuch of the responsibility
for themisery andmisfortune that the refugees of Shatila,
and many other camps in Lebanon and elsewhere, have
had to endure.

Allan rightfully insists that the ambivalence and dis-
affection among refugees that she documents cannot be
construed to mean that âZionism has won,â nor to in any
way âundermine the rights and claims of the refugeesâ
(p. 223). If anything, this book helps restore to the Pales-
tinians the moral authority that they are entitled to, and
that their lives so richly deserve. For new generations of
Palestinians to come, the right of return may be defined
and redefined, interpreted and reinterpreted, imagined
and reimagined, in multiple and complex ways, but it will
not go away. As long as Israel has a âlaw of returnâ that
allows any Jewish person anywhere in the world exclu-
sive rights to Israeli citizenship and identity, but excludes
the rights of the native peoples who were displaced and
dispossessed, Palestinians will always hold on to their
âright of return,â however they choose to define and in-
terpret it.

Note

[1]. Lila Abu Lughod, âWriting against Culture,â in
Recapturing Anthropology: Working in the Present, ed.
Richard G. Fox (Santa Fe: School of American Research
Press, 1991), 137-162.
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